
 
 

                        Pursuing Excellence in Public Service 
 
 
 
 
 
December 22, 2016 
 
 
 
 
 
Dear Interested Bidder:  
 
I would like to take this time to sincerely thank you for taking the time to submit your Bid to 
the City of Hutchinson.  The attached is the tabulation of the results of Bid 17-71.  

 

We have reviewed all of the bids received and have decided to proceed with a purchase 
from the lowest overall quoting vendor that meets specifications and abide by the City Of 
Hutchinson Local Preference Policy.  This will result in a purchases as follows: 
 
Midwest Superstore – Items #1, 3, 4, 5, for a total of $94,405.00 
Shawnee Mission Ford – Item #2 for a total of $27,157.00 
Allen Samuels CDJR – Item #6 for a total of $23,548.00 
Mel Hambelton – Items #7, 8, 9, 10, 11, for a total of $131,460.00 
        

   
If you have any additional questions, please feel free to contact my office at 694-1973.  
Once again thank your for your time and consideration. 
 
Sincerely, 
CITY OF HUTCHINSON 
 
 
 
Carmel White, Purchasing Agent 

 

 
PURCHASE ORDER WILL BE NOT BE RELEASED TO AWARDED VENDOR UNTIL AFTER               

JANUARY 1, 2017. 

P. O. Box 1567, Hutchinson, KS 67504-1567 
 
Telephone:  (620) 694-1973 
 
Office of:  Central Purchasing 
 



 

ITEM #1 – One (1) Half Ton Super/Double/Quad Cab Pickup for Inspection Department 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 1500 

Tradesman Quad 4x2 
$22,800.00  $22,800.00 

$22,966.00* 

+ 166.00 for 

Option* 

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Chevy 1500 

Double Cab 2wd 

$23,851.65  $23,851.65 

$24,023.65* 

+ 172.00 for 

option* 

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x2 

$22,579.00  $22,579.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-150 Super 

Cab 

$22,339.00  $22,339.28 

$22,215.00** 

Option 

included 

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x2 

$22,070.00  $22,070.00 

$22,457.00* 

+387.00 for 

option* 

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-150 Ext. Cab 

4x2 

$31,081.00 -8,400.00 $22,681.00 

$23,068.00* 

+387.00 for 

option* 

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 1500 

Quad 

$34,315.00 -9,328.00 $24,987.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-150 

Supercab 4x2 

$22,215.00  $22,215.00 Option 

Included 

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

RAM $27,627.00  $22,627.00  

**Local Preference 

 

ITEM #2 – One (1) Half Ton Heavy Duty Super/Double/Quad Cab 4x4 Pickup for WTC 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017  RAM 1500 

Tradesman Quad 4x4 
$27,685.00  $27,685.00  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Chevy 1500 

Double Cab 4x4 

$29,016.75  $29,016.75  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x2 

$29,436.00  $29,436.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-150 Super 

Cab 

$28,276.28  $28,276.28  

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x4 

$27,207.00  $27,207.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-150 Ext. Cab 

4x4 

$36,888.00 -8,400.00 $28,488.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 1500 

Quad 4x4 

$40,435.00 -10,019.00 $30,416.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-150 

Supercab 4x4 

$27,157.00  $27,157.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

RAM $27,408.00  $27,408.00  

 

 

 

 

 

 



ITEM #3 – One (1) Half Ton Heavy Duty Super/Double/Quad Cab 4x4 Pickup for Waste Water 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 1500 

Tradesman Quad 4x4 
$27,010.00  $27,010.00  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Chevy 1500 

Double Cab 4x4 

$29,016.75  $29,016.75  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x4 

$27,244.00  $27,244.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-150 Super 

Cab 

$27,594.28  $27,594.28 

$26,965.00** 

 

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x4 

$27,020.00  $27,020.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-150 Ext. Cab 

4x4 

$36,532.00 -8,400.00 $28,132.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 1500 

Quad 4x4 

$39,905.00 -9,972.00 $29,933.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-150 

Supercab 4x4 

$26,965.00  $26,965.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

RAM $26,860.00  $26,860.00*  

*Does not meet specifications 

**Local Preference 

ITEM #4 – One (1) Half Ton Super/Double/Quad Cab  Pickup for Utility Billing 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 1500 

Tradesman Quad 4x2 
$22,800.00  $22,800.00  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Chevy 1500 

Double Cab 2WD 

$24,903.75  $24,903.75  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x2 

$22,294.00  $22,294.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-150 Super 

Cab 

$22,474.28  $22,474.28 

$21,890.00** 

 

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x2 

$21,890.00  $21,890.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-150 Ext. Cab 

4x2 

$30,284.00 -8,400.00 $21,884.00*  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 1500 

Quad 

$34,315.00 -9,328.00 $24,987.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-150 

Supercab 4x2 

$21,930.00  $21,930.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

RAM $22,626.00  $22,626.00  

*Does not meet specifications 

**Local Preference 

 

 

 

 

 



ITEM #5 – One (1) Half Ton Super/Double/Quad Cab  Pickup for Engineering 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 1500 

Tradesman Quad 4x2 
$23,335.00  $23,335.00  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Chevy 1500 

Double Cab 2WD 

$24,903.25  $24,903.25  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x2 

$23,718.00  $23,718.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-150 Super 

Cab 

$23,706.28  $23,706.28 

$23,335.00** 

 

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F150 

Supercab 4x2 

$23,405.00  $23,405.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-150 Ext. Cab 

4x2 

$32,457.00 -8,400.00 $24,057.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 1500 

Quad 

$36,065.00 -10,321.00 $25,744.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-150 

Supercab 4x2 

$23,439.00  $23,439.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

RAM $22,979.00  $22,979.00*  

*Does not meet specifications 

**Local Preference 

 

ITEM #6 – One (1) Half Ton Heavy Duty Cargo Van for Police Department 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM Promaster 

1500 136 WB 
$25,700.00  $25,700.00  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

No Bid   No Bid  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford Transit 

Cargo MR 

$25,293.00  $25,293.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Transit 150 

low roof 

$25,170.28  $25,170.28  

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford Transit 

T150 LWB low 

roof van 

$25,630.00  $25,630.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

Ford ½ Ton Cargo $31,333.00 -5,000.00 $26,333.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 1500 

Promaster Cargo 

$33,965.00 -10,417.00 $23,548.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

No Bid   No Bid  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

No Bid   No Bid  

 

 

 

 

 



 

ITEM #7 – One (1) Three Quarter Ton Heavy Duty 4x4 Cab & Chassis for PW Maintenance 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 2500 

Tradesman Reg Cab4x4 
$25,550.00  $25,550.00*  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

No Bid   No Bid  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F250 

Regular cab 4x4 

$26,079.00  $26,079.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-350 Reg. 

Cab & Chassis 

$30,179.56  $30,179.56  

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F250 

Regular 4x4 

$25,770.00  $25,770.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-250 Ext. Cab 4x4 $34,834.00 -8,200.00 $26,634.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 2500 

Reg Cab 4x4 

$38,675.00 -10,230.00 $28,455.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-250 

Reg Cab Chassis 

$25,840.00  $25,840.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

No Bid   No Bid  

*Did not meet specifications 

 

ITEM #8 – One (1) Three Quarter Ton Heavy Duty Super/Double/Quad Cab & Chassis for 

Animal Control 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 2500 

Tradesman Crew 4x2 
$25,260.00  $25,260.00  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Chevy 2500 

Double Cab 2WD 

$27,158.96  $27,158.96  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F250 

Supercab 4x2 

$25,493.00  $25,493.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-350 Super 

Cab  & Chassis 

$29,060.56  $29,060.56  

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F250 

Supercab 4x2 

$25,180.00  $25,180.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-250 Ext. Cab 4x2 $34,598.00 -8,400.00 $26,198.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 2500 

Crew Cab 4x2 

$38,420.00 -10,976.00 $27,444.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-250 

Supercab & Chassis 

$25,254.00  $25,254.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

No Bid   No Bid  

 

 

 

 

 



ITEM #9 – One (1) Three Quarter Ton Heavy Duty Truck Cab & Chassis for Street Department 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 2500 

Tradesman Reg 4x2 
$24,515.00  $24,515.00  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

No Bid   No Bid  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F250 

4x2 

$23,038.00  $23,038.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-350 Regular 

Cab – 8’ bed 

$25,999.42  $25,999.42  

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F250 

Regular 4x2 

$22,725.00  $22,725.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-250 Ext. Cab 4x2 $32,119.00 -8,400.00 $23,719.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 2500 

Regular Cab 4x2 

$37,350.00 -9,957.00 $27,393.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-250 

Reg cab 4x2 

$22,829.00  $22,829.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

No Bid   No Bid  

 

 

ITEM #10 – One (1) One-Ton Heavy Duty Extended/Double/Quad Cab Chassis for Park 

Maintenance Department 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 3500 

Tradesman Crew 4x2 
$25,485.00  $25,485.00*  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

No Bid   No Bid  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F350 

Supercab 4x2 

$27,392.00  $27,392.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-350 Super 

Cab & Chassis 

$28,728.56  $28,728.56  

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F350 

Supercab 4x2 

$27,080.00  $27,080.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-350 Ext. Cab 4x2 $35,315.00 -8,200.00 $27,115.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 3500 

Crew Cab 4x2 

$38,795.00 -11,350.00 $27,445.00*  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-350 

Supercab & Chassis 

$27,153.00  $27,153.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

RAM $28,868.00  $28,868.00  

*Did not meet specifications 

 

 

 

 

 



ITEM #11 – One (1) One-Ton Heavy Duty Truck Cab & Chassis for Sewer Maintenance 

Department 

Vendor D               DESCRIPTION  UNIT 

QUOTE 

DISCOUNT NET 

AMOUNT 

Additional 

Information 

Davis-Moore Automotive 

Wichita, KS 

2017 RAM 4500 Cab & 

Chassis 144.5WB 60Ca 
$31,250.00  $31,250.00  

Midway Motors 

Hutchinson, KS 

No Bid   No Bid  

Midway Motors 

McPherson, KS 

2017 Ford F450 

Cab/Chassis 4x2 

$31,018.00  $31,018.00  

Midwest Superstore 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 F-450 Regular 

Cab & Chassis 

$31,658.56  $31,658.56  

Mel Hambelton  

Wichita, KS 

2017 Ford F450 

Regular cab 4x2 

$30,705.00  $30,705.00  

Hudiburg Ford, LLC 

Midwest City, OK 

F-450 Ext. Cab 4x2 $36,033.00 -4,400.00 $31,633.00  

Allen Samuels CDJR 

Hutchinson, KS 

2017 Ram 4500 

Reg Cab Chassis  

$39,110.00 -6,521.00 $32,589.00  

Shawnee Mission Ford 

Shawnee, KS 

2017 Ford F-450 

Reg cab & Chassis 

$30,766.00  $30,776.00  

Landmark Dodge 

Independence, MO 

No Bid   No Bid  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


