Pursuing Excellence in Public Service

January 23, 2017

Dear Interested Bidder:

P. O. Box 1567, Hutchinson, KS 67504-1567

Telephone: (620) 694-1973

Office of: Central Purchasing

| would like to take this time to sincerely thank you for taking the time to submit your Bid to
the City of Hutchinson. The following is the tabulation of the results of Bid 17-87.

VENDORS Item #1 Item #2 Item #3 Item #4 Total
2" Amendment Tactical 225.00/1,000 360.00/1,000 350.00/500 1,500.00 $33,620.00
South Hutchinson, KS $11,250.00 $20,520.00 $350.00 $1,500.00
GT Distributors, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.9178
Austin, TX $1,284.92
Ray O’Herron Co., Inc. A9 31 .55 No Bid $27,445.00
Danville, IL $9,500.00 $17,670.00 $275.00
ilirﬁzt LIGXV Enforcement 1798 3335 .666 No Bid $28,332.50
Y $8,990.00 $19,009.50 $333.00
Ultramax Ammunition 165 .2885 1.612 .645 $26,403.50
Rapid City, SD $8,250.00* $16,444.50* $806.00 $903.00
Speer Lawman Federal
53650 XM193

*Substitute Item Bid - Not Accepted

We have reviewed all of the bids received and have decided to proceed with a purchase
from the lowest overall quoting vendor that meets specifications and abide by the City Of
Hutchinson Local Preference Policy. This will result in a purchase of Item #1 from Sunset
Law Enforcement for a total of $8,990.00 and Items #2 and 3 from Ray O’Herron Co. for a
total of $$17,945.00 and a purchase of Item #4 from Ultramax Ammunition for a total of

$903.00.

If you have any additional questions, please feel free to contact my office at 694-1973.
Once again thank your for your time and consideration.

Sincerely,

CITY OF HUTCHINSON

Carmel White, Purchasing Agent




