P. O. Box 1567, Hutchinson, KS 67504-1567
Telephone: (620) 694-1973

Office of: Central Purchasing

Pursuing Excellence in Public Service
February 8, 2017
Dear Interested Bidder:

| would like to take this time to sincerely thank you for taking the time to submit your Bid to
the City of Hutchinson. The following is the tabulation of the results of Bid 17-90

Vendors Conrad Fire ED M. Feld Fire | Glenco Equipment | Weis Fire

Olathe, KS Equipment Co. Equipment

Carroll, 1A Worthington, OH Salina, KS
ITEM #1 1,497.25 1,611.00 NO BID 1,536.00
ITEM #2 335.58 390.00 NO BID 436.00
ITEM #3 5,526.00 5,777.00 NO BID NO BID
ITEM #4 558.24 540.00* NO BID 588.00
ITEM #5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 8,378.00
9,077.00*
ITEM #6 3,932.60 3,880.00 NO BID 2,240.00
ITEM #7 94.59 306.00 NO BID 108.00
ITEM #8 62.66 188.00 NO BID 72.00
ITEM #9 155.88 132.00 NO BID 186.00
ITEM #10 2,625.70 NO BID 2,415.77 NO BID
ITEM #11 300.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM #12 160.60 380.00 266.90 190.00
ITEM #13 198.80 580.00 228.60 220.00
ITEM #14 1,979.40 NO BID NO BID 1,190.00
TOTAL $17,427.90 $13,784.00 $2,911.27 $15,144.00

*Substituted items bid — Not Accepted
We have reviewed all of the bids received and have decided to proceed with a purchase
from the lowest overall quoting vendor that meets specifications and abide by the City of
Hutchinson Local Preference Policy. This will result in a purchase of Items #1-4, 7-8, and
11-13 from Conrad Fire for a total of $8,734.32, a purchase of Iltem #9 from Ed M. Feld
Fire for a total of $132.00, a purchase of Item #10 from Glenco Equipment for a total of
$2,415.77 and a purchase of Items #5-6 and 14 from Weis Fire for a total of $11,808.00.

If you have any additional questions, please feel free to contact my office at 694-1973.
Once again thank you for your time and consideration.

Sincerely,
CITY OF HUTCHINSON

Carmel White, Purchasing Agent



